RESULTS OF DAC & DATIC TENDERS OPENED ON 23RP JUNE, 2026

MOALD/SDA/ENG/DAC/01//2025-2026

CONSTRUCTION OF KIAMAKUU AGGREGATION CENTRE IN TIGANIA CENTRAL
CONSTITUENCY, MERU COUNTY

$/N | NAME OF THE FIRM QUOTED BID BID EXPIRY
AMOUNT SECURITY SECURITY DATE
AMOUNT SOURCE

1. KANANAHU

CONTRACTORS & GENERAL RAFIKI

SUPPLIERS LIMITED MICRO

P.O BOX 16478-00610, FINANCE

NAIROBI 54,906,254.94 | 1,190,000.00 | BANK 11/5/2027
2. BRANCH

MUCORE ENTERPRISES MICRO

LIMITED FINANCE

P.O BOX 147-60200, MERU | 56,499,685.00 | 1,190,000.00 | BANK LTD 14/10/2026
3. RAFIKI

FOXMAP GROUP LIMITED MICRO

P.O BOX 20685-00100, FINANCE

NAIROBI 57,553,797.83 | 1,190,000.00 | BANK 12/2/2027
4. KINDE ENGINEERING RAFIKI

WORKS LTD MICRO

P.O BOX 6911-00300, FINANCE

NAIROBI 56,163,537.15 | 1,190,000.00 | BANK 11/5/2027

MOALD/SDA/ENG/DAC/02//2025-2026
SUPPLY, DELIVERY AND INSTALLATION OF MAMA SHOPS FOR VARIOUS COUNTIES
$/N | NAME OF THE FIRM QUOTED BID BID EXPIRY
AMOUNT SECURITY SECURITY DATE
AMOUNT SOURCE

1. RAFIKI

MEDIFIN INVEST LTD MICRO

P.O BOX 14978-00100, FINANCE

NAIROBI 49,091,976.74 | 1,102,921.00 | BANK 8/11/2027
2. ACCREAGE HOLDINGS RAFIKI

LIMITED MICRO

P.O BOX 80559-80100, FINANCE

MOMBASA 55,536,745.57 | 1,102,921.00 | BANK 18/1/2027
3. RAFIKI

MICRO
MALTIMAX LIMITED FINANCE
P.O BOX 11-00610, NAIROBI | 49,042,092.00 | 1,102,921.00 | BANK 20/3/2027




4. MOMANNEST ENTERPRISES

LIMITED, P.O BOX 95,

LITEIN 54,661,015.20 | 1,102,921.00 | NCBA 21/10/2026
5. PONMAR ENGINEERING RAFIKI

LIMITED MICRO

P.O BOX 47244-00100, FINANCE

NAIROBI 55,095,128.00 | 1,102,921.00 | BANK 20/12/2026
6. CHEMETET INVESTMENT RAFIKI

COMPANY LIMITED MICRO

P.O BOX 22222-00100, FINANCE

NAIROBI 43,484,760.00 | 1,102,921.00 | BANK 18/1/2027
7. RUBICON BROTHERS RAFIKI

LIMITED MICRO

P.O BOX 31355-00600, FINANCE

NAIROBI 65,962,820.00 | 1,102,921.00 | BANK 19/4/2027

MOALD/SDA/ENG/DAC/03//2025-2026
CONSTRUCTION OF NDARAWETA MOGINDO AGGREGATION AND FERTILIZER CENTRE IN

BOMET CENTRAL CONSTITUENCY, BOMET COUNTY

$/N | NAME OF THE FIRM QUOTED BID BID EXPIRY
AMOUNT SECURITY SECURITY DATE
AMOUNT SOURCE
1. RAFIKI
MICRO
NAFICO COMPANY LIMITED FINANCE
P.O BOX 777-20406 SOTIK 37,401,089.90 | 800,000.00 | BANK 18/01/2027
2. BOMET SAVANNAH
ENTERPRISES LIMITED NO BID NO BID NO BID
P.O BOX 230-20400 BOMET | 34,930,199.35 | SECURITY SECURITY SECURITY
3. HANSHY INVESTMENT RAFIKI
COMPANY LIMITED MICRO
P.O BOX 44379-00100, FINANCE
NAIROBI 46,499,621.17 | 800,000.00 | BANK 29/01/2027

MOALD/SDA/ENG/DAC/04//2025-2026

CONSTRUCTION OF TAITA AGGREGATION AND FERTILIZER CENTRE IN KURESOI SOUTH

CONSTITUENCY, NAKURU COUNTY

$/N | NAME OF THE FIRM QUOTED BID BID EXPIRY
AMOUNT SECURITY SECURITY DATE
AMOUNT SOURCE
STRATEGIC STATIONERS RAFIKI
1. SUPPLIES LTD. 54,590,278.34 | 895,000.00 | MICRO 14/12/2026




P.O BOX 751-20200, FINANCE
KERICHO BANK
TRUSS INTERNATIONAL 895,000.00
LIMITED
P.O BOX 12759-00400,
2. NAIROBI 57,009,926.05 AMACO 210 DAYS
NASAMAHA INVESTMENTS 895,000.00 | RAFIKI
LIMITED MICRO
P.O BOX 185-70300, FINANCE
3. MANDERA 44,493,597.20 BANK 18/02/2027
895,000.00 | RAFIKI
NOTHERN DYKES LIMITED MICRO
P.O BOX 499-00610, FINANCE
4. NAIROBI 49,513,260.64 BANK 20/12/2026
VIBECAT LTD 895,000.00
P.O BOX 8260-00100,
5. NAIRROBI 43,260,451.60 SMEP BANK | 25/02/2027
DIISO CONSTRUCTION 895,000.00 | RAFIKI
LIMITED MICRO
P.O BOX 458-70100, FINANCE
6. GARISSA 39,422,956.74 BANK 20/11/2026
JUBALINK LOGISTICS & 895,000.00 | RAFIKI
TRANSPORT CO. LTD MICRO
P.O BOX 13453-00800, FINANCE
7. NAIROBI 39,375,731.95 BANK 20/11/2026
QUADTECH ENGINEERING 895,000.00 | RAFIKI
LTD MICRO
P.O BOX 15134-00100, FINANCE
8. NAIROBI 44,290,080.91 BANK 20/11/2026
BORON HARDWARES & 895,000.00 | RAFIKI
GENERAL WORKS LTD MICRO
P.O BOX 888267-80100 FINANCE
0. MOMBSA 44,0066,302.26 BANK 19/11/2026
895,000.00 | RAFIKI
LE BUNEEL DIVERSITY LTD MICRO
P.O BOX 45128-00100, FINANCE
10. | NAIROBI 51,328,244.85 BANK 17/6/2027
895,000.00 | RAFIKI
BIZRATE ENTERPRISES LTD MICRO
P.O BOX 16069-20100, FINANCE
11. | NAKURU 40,925,833.22 BANK 20/11/2026

MOALD/SDA/ENG/DAC/05//2025-2026

BAKULE AGGREGATION CENTRE AND (PHASE 11) IN SOY CONSTITUENCY, UASIN GISHU
COUNTY




$/N | NAME OF THE FIRM QUOTED BID BID EXPIRY
AMOUNT SECURITY SECURITY DATE
AMOUNT SOURCE
TRUSS INTERNATIONAL
LIMITED
P.O BOX 12759-00400,
1. NAIROBI 26,252,050.77 | 664,140.00 AMACO 210 DAYS
RAFIKI
RAYNARD ENTERPRISES LTD MICRO
P.O BOX 2721-00100, FINANCE
2. ELDORET 30,686,913.18 | 664,140.00 BANK 20/11/2026
TASHAQ ENTERPRISE RAFIKI
LIMITED MICRO
P.O BOX 9140-00300, FINANCE
3. RONALD NGARA STREET 32,989,536.61 | 664,140.00 BANK 16/6/2026
RAFIKI
SKYBULL AFRICA LIMITED MICRO
P.O BOX 6877-00300, FINANCE
4. NAIROBI 31,542,931.18 | 664,140.00 BANK 20/11/2026
MOALD/SDA/ENG/DATIC/01//2025-2026
AGRICULTURAL FARM ACCESS ROAADS IN KONOIN (KOBEL-SATIET-NYANGOMBE-
KOMIRMIR-CHEPCHEIGO-MURAMET-KIGONOR-AREGERIOTROADS) IN KONOIN
CONSTITUENCY, BOMET COUNTY
BID
QUOTED SECURITY BID SECURITY EXPIRY
$/N | NAME OF THE FIRM AMOUNT AMOUNT SOURCE DATE
BRILANKO INVESTMENT
LTD
P.O BOX 81-20404,
1. NDANAI 28,769,972.00 | 700,000 RAFIKI 29/1/2027
YAYSIIR CONSTRUCTION
COMPANY LIMITED
P.O BOX 184-70200,
2. WAJIR 31,027,854.00 | 700,000 RAFIKI 14/11/2026
BRICATE DEVELOPMENT
LIMITED BRANCH
P.O BOX 4129-00100, MICRO
3. NAIROBI 30,747,261.60 | 780,000 FINANCE 20/11/2026
MAGIC GLOVE LIMITED MIDDLE EAST
P.O BOX 23023-00505, BANK KENYA
4. NAIROBI 32,259,959.60 | 666,072 LTD 19/5/2027
KALION INVESTMENTS
5. LIMITED 21,480,439.20 | 700,000 RAFIKI 14/11/2026




P.O BOX
NAIROBI

7887-00100,

JAMAYA ALIUMINIUM (K)
LTD

P.O BOX
NAIROBI

8757-00610,

30,380,284.00

700,000

RAFIKI

14/12/2026

ISPAL VENTURES LIMITED
P.O BOX 1475-00621,
VILLAGE MARKET

32,820,761.60

3,282,076.16

RAFIKI

20/11/2026

EVASAL INVESTMENT
LIMITED
P.O BOX
BOMET

489-20400,

29,813,119.40

700,000

SIDIAN BANK

15/10/2026

SIMONGIKO VALLEY
WORKS ENTERPRISES LTD
P.O BOX  230-20400,
BOMET

29,554,201.60

NO BID SECURITY

10.

BAM PROPERTIES LIMITED
P.O BOX 74824-00200,
NAIROBI

69,201,461.02

1,500,000

MIDDLE EAST
BANK KENYA
LTD

14/2/2027

11.

SANABIL CONSTRUCTION
AND SUPPLIERS LIMITED
P.O BOX 38-80403, KWALE

29,584,570.40

700,000

RAFIKI

23/3/2027

12.

GURUN AGENCY LIMITED
P.O BOX 68762-00622,
NAIROBI

34,328,070.00

700,000

RAFIKI

20/12/2026

13.

MUMANNEST
ENTERPRISES LIMITED
P.O BOX 95, LITEIN

34,504,485.00

700,000

NCBA

15/10/2026

14.

MAW HOLDINGS LIMITED
P.O BOX 16417-00610,
NAIROBI

31,096,120.00

700,000

RAFIKI

20/12/2026

15.

TULA GENERAL
CONTRACTORS &
SUPPLIES LTD
P.O BOX
NAIROBI

106137-00101,

31,501,122.00

700,000

RAFIKI

14/3/2027

16.

CHEKN
LIMITED
P.O BOX
NAIROBI

CONTRACTORS

15560-00400,

20,472,144.00

700,000

RAFIKI

20/11/2026

17.

EPHORIA COMPANY
LIMITED

P.O BOX 101076-00101,
JAMIA MOAQUE

42,803,420.00

700,000

RAFIKI

20/12/2026

18.

JACKAAMO KENYA
LIMITED

31,839,390.00

700,000

RAFIKI

20/3/2027




P.O BOX 559-20400,
BOMET

19.

ANWILLAN KENYA
LIMITED

P.O BOX 20710-00202,
NAIROBI

28,975,918.40

700,000

RAFIKI

20/11/2026

20.

P.O BOX 8576-30100,
ELDORET

21.

DIRECTOR
LIMITED
PO BOX
ELDORET

ROKOCHE

962-30100,

30,797,408.00

700,000

RAFIKI

20/11/2026

22.

PETHER CONSTRUCTION
AND GENERAL
P.O BOX
GITHUNGURI

715-00216

36,721,749.00

700,000

BRANCH
MICROFINANCE

18/11/2026

23.

COPYCATE ENTERPRISES
LTD

P. BOX 2707-20100,
NAKURU

33,067,261.26

700,000

FAMILY BANK

8/11/2026

24.

LAYLAN HOLDINGS
LIMITED
P.O BOX 18- SILIBWET

32,241,202.40

700,000

BRANK BANK

22/12/2026

25.

ZOOMLAND LIMITED
P.O BOX 84-20200,
KERICHO

28,213,125.60

700,000

SIDIAN BANK

15/12/2026

26.

JAKAMA ENGINEERING
LIITED

P.O BOX 308-30100,
ELDORET

27.

SAFI OMNI BUILD
SOLUTIONS COMPANY
LIMITED

P.O BOX 62743-00200,
NAIROBI

21,650,000.00

700,000

BRANCH
MICRO
FINANCE BANK
LTD

14/11/2026

28.

BAM PROPERTIES LIMITED
P.O BOX 74824-00200,
NAIROBI

33,497,552.00

1,500,000

MIDDLE EAST
BANK KENYA
LIMITED

14/02/2027

MOALD/SDA/ENG/DATIC/02//2025-2026

REHABILITATION KIVUNO PHASE Il DAM IN KIPKELION EAST CONSTITUENCY, KERICHO
COUNTY

S/N

NAME OF THE FIRM

QUOTED
AMOUNT

BID
SECURITY
AMOUNT

BID
SECURITY
SOURCE

EXPIRY
DATE




HAMDAN INVESTMENTS
LIMITED
P.O BOX 76-00610, NAIROBI

69,431,141.12

1,500,000

RAFIKI

18/02/2027

QOROXEEY INVESTMENTS
LIMITED

P.O BOX 123-00100,
NAIROBI

72,071,081.46

1,500,000

RAFIKI

12/02/2027

GABANO INVESTMENTS LTD
P.O BOX 309-70300,
MANDERA

73,759,266.00

1,500,000

RAFIKI

14/11/2026

JUMA  APEI
LIMITED

P.O BOX
NAIROBII

COMPANY

51357-00200,

71,352,529.16

1,500,000

RAFIKI

1/05/2027

ELDAN COM PANY LIMITED
P.O BOX 442-20100, AKURU

90,091,482.36

1,500,000

FAMILY
BANK

12/11/2026

MOAL/SDA/ENG/DATIC/03/2025-2026

AGRICULTURAL FARM ACCESS ROADS IN NYOTA (TIRIGOI-KAPKEMBU- CHEMUSIAN
FACTORY, LELPANGA- TAACH ASIS FACTORY- KIPLEMEIYWO, TETA PRIMARY- SAHAMBA
NDEFU, SINENDET - KOISEGUT AND BARARGET CENTRE- BARARGET DISPENSARY ROADS)
IN KERESOI SOUTH CONSTITUENCY, NAKURU COUNT

S/NO | NAME OF | ADDRESS TOTAL BID BID SECURITY | EXPIRING
THE FIRM AMOUNT SECURITY AMOUNT DATE
QUOTED SOURCE

1. | BETRI P.O BOX 276 | 45,995,778 NCBA 920,875 15T
COMPANY | LONDIANI OCTOBER,2
LIMITED 026

2. | BLUEPLAN | P.O BOX 59- | 41564,168.80 | RAFIKI 920,875 23RD
ET 70103 MICROFINA MARCH
CONCOR | DADAAB NACE BANK 2027
DIA
LIMITED

3. | CIDRICH |P.OBOX®61- |34,447,661.60 | AMACO 920,875 23RD FEB,
LIMITED | 20131 2027

KERINGET

4. | siDDY P.O BOX 42,922,981.20 | MIDDLE 920,875 19T™H MAY,
INVESTME | 36874-00200 EAST BANK 2027
NT NAIROBI KENYA
LIMITED (MEB)

5. | EDPAUS P.O BOX 22- | 36,293,880.48 | AMACO 920,875 23R FEB,
SUPPLIES & | 20100 2027
CONSTRU | NAKURU
CTION
LIMITED




6. | BANDURY | P.O BOX 234- | 43,999,746.56 | RAFIKI 800,000 14™ DEC,
INTERNAT | OLENGURUO MICROFINA 2026
IONAL NE NACE BANK
KENYA
LIMITED

7. | MOTHAM | P.O BOX 45,017,535.20 | RAFIKI 920,875 18™ FEB,
INVESTME | 74824-00200 MICROFINA 2027
NTS NAIROBI NACE BANK
LIMITED

8. | TASLIM P.O BOX 44,604.252.00 | MIDDLE 920,875 20™ DEC,
GLOBAL | 104390 EAST BANK 2026
VENTURES | JAMIA KENYA
LIMITED (MEB)

9. | COPYCARE | P.O BOX 43,957,883.76 | FAMILY 920,875 8™ NOV,
ENTERPRIS | 2707-20100 BANK 2026
ES LIMITED | NAKURU

10.| TRANSWO | P.O BOX 39,346,098.00 | RAFIKI 3,950,000 20™ DEC,
RK 41323-00100 MICROFINA 2026
SUPPLIES & | NAIROBI NACE BANK
CONSTRU
CTION
LTD

11. | DIISO P.O BOX 458- | 40,508,151.20 | RAFIKI 920,875 20™ NOV,
CONSTRU | 70100 MICROFINA 2026
CTION GARISSA NACE BANK
LIMITED

12.| BISHMARK | P.O BOX 28,590,056.00 | RAFIKI 920,875 14™ DEC,
ENTERPRIS | 18481-20100 MICROFINA 2026
ES LIMITED | NAIROBI NACE BANK

13.| STEEL MAZ | P.O BOX 43,768,714.00 | RAFIKI 920,875 2370 JUNE,
LIMITED | 43253-00100 MICROFINA 2027

NACE BANK

14.| AYUNIA | P.O BOX 42,967,258.40 | RAFIKI 920,875 18™ FEB,
COMPANY | 1744-70200 MICROFINA 2027
LIMITED | GARISAA NACE BANK

15.| MANN P.O BOX 40,364,346.00 | RAFIKI 920,875 20™ NOV,
CONSULT | 50730-00100 MICROFINA 2026
ANTS LTD | NBI NACE BANK

16.| TULA P.O BOX 39,744,848.00 | RAFIKI 920,875 14T
GENERAL | 106137-00100 MICROFINA MARCH,
CONSTRA | NAIROBI NACE BANK 2027
CTORS &

SUPPLIERS
LTD

17.| VIBECAT | P.O BOX 44,263,674.40 | SMEP BANK | 920,875 25T FEB,

LTD 8260-00100 2027

NAIROBI




18.| RIALI P.O BOX 40,339,208.80 | BRANCH 920,875 20™ DEC,
ENTERPRIS | 21165-00100 MICROFINA 2026
ES LIMITED | NAIROBI NCE BANK

19.| ETIKO P.O BOX 41,358,094.80 | RAFIKI 920,875 20™
SUPREMA | 15645-20100 MICROFINA NOV,2026
CIES NAKURU NACE BANK
LIMITED

20.| QIPHILL P.O BOX 32- | 20,669,936.00 | RAFIKI 920,875 14™ DEC,
CONSTRA | 20211 MICROFINA 2026
CTORS NACE BANK
LIMITED

21.| LABRANA | P.O BOX 35- | 31,418,948.00 | RAFIKI 920,875 20™ NOV,
ENTERPRIS | 20100 MICROFINA 2026
ES LIMITED | NAKURU NACE BANK

22.| JAITAX P.O BOX 722- | 48,910,356.00 | AMACO 920,875 148 DAYS
ENTERPRIS | 20200
ES LIMITED

23.| PRINT P.O BOX 34,812,470.00 | AMACO 920,875 210 DAYS
AFRICA 8017-00610
LTD NAIROBI

24.| KIEMO P.O BOX 38,107,484.80 | RAFIKI 920,875 20™ NOV,
HOLDINGS | 99962-80100 MICROFINA 2027
LIMITED MOMBASA NACE BANK

25.| WIDESCOP | P.O BOX 40,578,076.00 | RAFIKI 920,875 10™ FEB,
E 1073-00100 MICROFINA 2027
CONSTRU | NAIROBI NACE BANK
CTION
LTD

26.| SUBBASE P.O BOX 28- | 38,211,734 KCB BANK 920,875 20™ NOV,
LIMITED 20500 2026

NAROK

MOAL/SDA/ENG/DATIC/04/2025-2026

AGRICULTURAL FARM ACCESS ROADS IN NYOTA WARD (MASAITA MWAE, KAMWAURA-
LELAITICH, CHEPKINOIYO- JASHO GITHUGURI AND LAMJU- MAWINGU PRIMARY- BOMAS
ROADS) IN KURESOI NORTH CONSTITUENCY, NAKURU COUNTY

$/NO | NAME OF ADDRESS TOTAL BID BID EXPIRING
THE FIRM AMOUNT SECURITY SECURITY DATE
QUOTED SOURCE AMOUNT
1. | ETIKO P.O BOX 29,902,422 RAFIKI 2,990,242.2 | 20™
SUPREMACIE | 51645-20100 MICROFINA NOV,
S COMPANY | NAKURU NACE BANK 2026
LIMITED




2. [ LABRANA P.OBOX 35- | 20,659,078 | RAFIKI 666,072 20 NOV,
ENTERPRISES | 20100 MICROFINA 2026
LIMITED NAKURU NACE BANK

3. | LANDMARK | P.O BOX 32,315,220 | RAFIKI 666,072 20™ DEC,
SYSTEM 10490-00100 MICROFINA 2026
LIMITED NAIROBI NACE BANK

4. [NAOMAX |P.OBOX 124 |28,822,288 | RAFIKI 895,000 20 DEC
COMPANY | NAKURU MICROFINA ,2026
LIMITED NACE BANK

5. | DIISO P.O BOX 458- | 29,289,942 | RAFIKI 666,072 20™
CONSTRUCT | 70100 MICROFINA NOV,
ION GARISSA NACE BANK 2026
LIMITED

6. | SMALL NINE | P.O BOX 29,862,228 | RAFIKI 666,072 18™ FEB
LIMITED 62049-00200 MICROFINA 2027

NAIROBI NACE BANK

7. | SOLIAT P.O BOX 1201- | 22,996,710 | RAFIKI 666,072 14T™H NOV,
INVESTMEN | 20100 MICROFINA 2026
TLIMITED | NAKURU NACE BANK

8. | MAGIC P.O BOX 32,149,074 | MIDDLE 666,072 19TH MAY,
GLOVE 23023-00505 EAST BANK 2027
LIMITED NAIROBI KENYA

(MEB)

9. | WENVY P.O BOX 722- | 34,836,076 | AMACO 666,072 148 DAYS
INVESTMEN | 20200
T LIMITED | KERICHO

10.| SUNRISE P.O BOX 425- | 30,217,130 RAFIKI 666,072 18™ FEB,
HANDLERS | 00101 MICROFINA 2027
LIMITED NAIROBI NACE BANK

11. | BETTAL P.O BOX 33,397,386 | SIDIAN 666,072 215T OCT,
INVESTMEN | 45772-20200 BANK 2026
T LIMITED | KERICHO

12.| EDPAUS P.OBOX22- |25,971,704 | AMACO 666,072 238 DAYS
SUPPLIES & | 20100
CONSTRUCT | NAKURU
ION
LIMITED

13.| VICSANG P.OBOX29- |28,375050 | KCB 666,072 20T
LIMITED 20401 CHE NOV,

BUNYO 2026

14.| GOLDENSITE | P.O BOX 782- | 30,109,134 RAFIKI 666,072 14™H NOV,

LIMITED 70200 WAJIA MICROFINA 2026
NACE BANK

15.| KEABLINK | P.O BOX 29,401,911 RAFIKI 666,072 20™
ENTERPRISES | 8552-30100 MICROFINA NOV,
LIMITED ELDORET NACE BANK 2026




16. | ANINA P.O BOX 37,150,740 RAFIKI 666,072 20™ DEC,
HOLDINGS 8478-00100 MICROFINA 2026
LIMITED NAIROBI NACE BANK

17.| TULA P.O BOX 29,309,720 RAFIKI 666,072 14™
GENERAL 106137-00101 MICROFINA MARCH,
CONTRACT | NAIROBI NACE BANK 2027
ORS &

SUPPLIERS
LIMITED

18.| RIALI P.O BOX 32,166,684 BRANCH 666,072 20™
ENTERPRISES | 21165-00100 MICROFINA NOV,
LIMITED NAIROBI NCE BANK 2026

MOAL/SDA/ENG/DATIC/05/2025-2026
CONSTRUCTION OF ABAQFIN WATER PAN IN WAJIR EAST CONSTITUENCY, WAJIR
COUNTY
$/NO | NAME OF ADDRESS TOTAL BID SECURITY | BID EXPIRY
THE FIRM AMOUNT SOURCE SECURITY | DATE
QUOTED AMOUNT

1. | JUBALINK P.O 65,233,948.50 | RAFIKI 1,482,599 | 20TH
LOGISTICS & | BOX13453- MICROFINAN NOVEMBE
TRANSPORT | 00800 ACE BANK R, 2026

NAIROBI

2. | SIDDY P.O BOX 42,744,494.32 | MIDDLE EAST | 1,482,599 | 19TH
INVESTMEN | 36874- BANK KENYA MAY,

T LIMITED 00200 (MEB) 2027
NAIROBI

3. | DEWLIGHT P.O BOX 69,820,657.57 | RAFIKI 1,482,599 | 22ND
HOLDING 1640- MICROFINAN APRIL,
LIMITED 80302 ACE BANK 2027

TAVETA

4. | MASHUU P.O BOX 6- | 72,012,609.90 | RAFIKI 1,482,599 | 18TH FEB,
INVESTMEN | 70200 MICROFINAN 2027
T LIMITED WAJIR ACE BANK

5. | FLEXI P.O BOX 69,166,263.60 | RAFIKI 1,400,000 | 20TH
AFRICA 674-00610 MICROFINAN DEC, 2026
LIMITED NAIROBI ACE BANK

6. | OLIMPIA P.O BOX 69,988,413.60 | RAFIKI 1,482,599 | 12TH FEB,
EXPRESS 1846-00100 MICROFINAN 2027
LIMITED NAIROBI ACE BANK

7. | BILANAMIN | P.O BOX 69,981,339.56 | RAFIKI 1,482,599 | 19TH FEB,
CONSTRUCT | 264-70200 MICROFINAN 2027
ION & WAJIR ACE BANK
SUPPLY
COMPANY
LTD




AFRICENT
ENTERPRISES
LIMITED

P.O BOX
10051-
00100
NAIROBI

70,555,472.57

RAFIKI 1,482,599 | 22ND
MICROFINAN APRIL,
ACE BANK 2027

MOAL/SDA/ENG/DATIC/06/2025-2026
CONSTRUCTION OF SOKORORBEI FARMERS BRIDGE IN CHEPALUNGU CONSTITUENCY,

BOMET COUNTY
S/N | NAME OF [ ADDRESS | TOTAL BID BID EXPIRING
O | THEFIRM AMOUNT SECURITY | SECURITY | DATE
QUOTED SOURCE AMOUNT
1. | BETTAL P.O BOX 17,036,427.87 | SIDIAN 344,625 | 215 OCT, 2026
INVESTMEN | 45772- BANK
T LIMITED | 20200 (COPY
KERICHO ATTACHED
)
2.| DEFLON P.O BOX 34,711,540.76 | RAFIKI 344,625 | 19™ APRIL,
INVESTMEN | 16710- MICROFIN 2027
T 00100 ANACE
COMPANY | NAIROBI BANK
LIMITED
3.| JAKAMA P.O BOX - - - -
ENGINEERI | 308-30100
NG ELDORET
LIMITED
4.| REALSCAPE | P.O BOX 20,510,825.94 | RAFIKI 344,625 | 29™ JAN, 2027
VENTURES | 1802-20200 MICROFIN
LIMITED KERICHO ANACE
BANK
5.| EBSAM P.O BOX 38,892,696.92 | MIDDLE 344,625 | 19™ MAY, 2027
VENTURES | 103121- EAST BANK
LIMITED 00101 KENYA
NAIROBI (MEB)
6.| DIISO P.O BOX 15,053,359.90 | RAFIKI 1,655,869. | 20™ NOV,
CONSTRUC | 458-70100 MICROFIN | 59 2026
TION GARISSA ANACE
LIMITED BANK
7. JUBALINK | P.O BOX 15,152,951.70 | RAFIKI 1,655,869. | 20™ NOV,
LOGISTICS | 13453- MICROFIN | 59 2026
& 00800 ANACE
TRANSPOR | NAIROBI BANK
T
COMPANY
LIMITED




.| MZIBALINE

LIMITED

P.O BOX
123-60601
LAARE

20,712,032

RAFIKI
MICROFIN
ANACE
BANK

344,625

20™ DEC,
2026

MOAL/SDA/ENG/DATIC/07/2025-2026

DRILLING AND EQUIPPING OF EBIGOGO PRIMARY SCHOOL BOREHOLE IN BOBASI
CONSTITUENCY, KISIl COUNTY

/N | NAME OF ADDRESS TOTAL BID SECURITY | BID EXPIRING
O THE FIRM AMOUNT SOURCE SECURITY | DATE
QUOTED AMOUNT
JAICAR P.O BOX 18,527,035.12 RAFIKI 390,000 12™ NOV,
ENGINEERIN | 2018- MICROFINAN 2026
G 30100 ACE BANK
ENTERPRISE | ELDORET
LIMITED
.| PUMPTECH | P.O BOX 13,994,690 RAFIKI 390,000 17™ DEC,
SOLUTIONS | 569-00100 MICROFINAN 2026
LIMITED NAIROBI ACE BANK
.| SAFELINE P.O BOX 18,479,465.84 | MIDDLE EAST | 390,000 29™ APRIL,
INDUSTRIES | 18688- BANK KENYA 2027
LIMITED 00100 (MEB)
NAIROBI
.| TRANSGENI | P.O BOX 16,147,023.33 RAFIKI 390,000 23RP JUNE,
C 80273- MICROFINAN 2027
SOLUTIONS | 00100 ACE BANK
LIMITED NAIROBI
.| PECAR P.O BOX 15,623,786.77 | RAFIKI 390,000 13™
INVESTMEN | 43949- MICROFINAN MARCH,
TS LIMITED | 00100 ACE BANK 2027
NAIROBI
.| ALFA P.O BOX 25,857,108.99 | - - -
GEOSCIENCE | 111-80100
KENYA MOMBASA
LIMITED
.| OSB AFRICA | P.O BOX 18,980,053.40 | RAFIKI 390,000 14™ DEC,
LIMITED 23001- MICROFINAN 2026
00505 ACE BANK
NAIROBI
.| ZAMIL P.O BOX 16,364,589.63 RAFIKI 390,000 20™ NOV,
CONSTRUCT | 811-70100 MICROFINAN 2026
ION & GARISSA ACE BANK




TRANSPORT
ERS LIMITED

MOAL/SDA/ENG/DATIC/08/2025-2026

DRILLING AND EQUIPPING OF NGENDALEL BOREHOLE IN SOIN/ SIGOWET
CONSTITUENCY, KERICHO COUNTY

/N | NAME OF ADDRESS TOTAL BID BID EXPIRING
O THE FIRM AMOUNT SECURITY | SECURITY | DATE
QUOTED SOURCE | AMOUNT
LAMRINET | P.O BOX 8- 19,999,966.01 444,271 SIDIAN 16™ DEC,2026
KENYA 20152 BANK
LIMITED OLENGURUO
NE
PECAR P.O BOX 19,938,267.51 444,271 RAFIKI 13™ MARCH,
INVESTMEN | 43949-00100 MICROFIN | 2027
T LIMITED | NAIROBI ANACE
BANK
.| BRIGHTON | P.O BOX 21,533,089.51 444,271 RAFIKI 23RD APRIL,
S BRIDGE 14499-20900 MICROFIN | 2027
KENYA NAKURU ANACE
LIMITED BANK
.| HONEYWEL | P.O BOX 21,283,474,18 444,271 RAFIKI 17™ APRIL,
L LIMITED 16500-00100 MICROFIN | 2027
NAIROBI ANACE
BANK
.| JAKAMA P.O BOX 308- | - - -
ENGINEERI | 30100
NG ELDORET
LIMITED
.| SKYRIDGE P.O BOX 14,500,000.00 | 444,271 SIDIAN 14™ DEC,
BUSINESS 2331 BANK 2026
LIMITED KERICHO
.| JOPAL P.O BOX 22,877,300.33 | 444,271 RAFIKI 20™ DEC,
INVESTMEN | 69325-00400 MICROFIN | 2026
TS LIMITED | NAIROBI ANACE
BANK
RAYNARD | P.O BOX 23,537,559.19 | 444,271 RAFIKI 20™ NOV,
ENTERPRISE | 2721-00300 MICROFIN | 2026
S LIMITED ELDORET




ANACE
BANK
9.| PSLWATER | P.O BOX 18,299,315.00 | 444,271 | RAFIKI 17™ OCT,
ENGINEERI | 46178-00100 MICROFIN | 2026
NG NAIROBI ANACE
LIMITED BANK
10| VICROSH | P.O BOX 24911,305.84 | 444,271 | AMACO | 148 DAYS
CONSTRUC | 900-20200
TION KERICHO
LIMITED
11.] ALPHA P.OBOX 11- | 38,850,308.00 |- -
GEOSCIENC | 80100
ES LIMITED | NAIROBI
12 MAMOLA | P.O BOX 15,947.828.60 | 444,271 | FIDELITY | 150 DAYS
COMPANY | 79938-00200 INSURANC
LIMITED NAIROBI E
13] JR MILES P.O BOX 108- | 21,306,059.38 | 444,271 | RAFIKI 15™ JAN,
CONSTRUC | 00100 MICROFIN | 2027
TION NAIROBI ANACE
LIMITED BANK
14| BIRSHMAR | P.O BOX 15,996,995.34 | 444,271 | RAFIKI 14™ DEC,
T 18481-20100 MICROFIN | 2026
ENTERPRISE | NAKURU ANACE
S LIMITED BANK
15] cycLIC P.O BOX 20,998,672.64 | 444271 | MIDDLE | 29™ APRIL,
INVESTMEN | 18465-00100 EAST 2027
TS LIMITED | NAIROBI BANK
KENYA
(MEB)
MOAL/SDA/ENG/DATIC/09/2025-2026
DRILLING AND EQUIPPING OF NYALILBUCH BOREHOLE IN SOIN/ SIGOWET
CONSTITUENCY, KERICHO COUNTY
S/NO | NAME OF ADDRESS TOTAL BID BID EXPIRING
THE FIRM AMOUNT SECURITY | SECURITY | DATE
QUOTED SOURCE | AMOUNT
1. | PUMPTECH P.O BOX 569- | 16,701,727 RAFIKI 414,270 | 17™ DEC,
SOLUTIONS | 00100 NAIROBI MICROFIN 2026
LIMITED ANACE
BANK
2.| ALPHA P.OBOX 111- | 38,850,308 - - -
GEOSCIENCE | 80100
KENYA MOMBASA
LIMITED




. BARINA P.O BOX 701- | 20,089,977 RAFIKI 414,270 | 18™ FEB,
INDUSTRIAL | 00100 NAIROBI MICROFIN 2027
LIMITED ANACE

BANK
4.| JAKAMA P.O BOX 308- |- - - -
ENGINEERING | 30100
LIMITED ELDORET
. QIPHILL P.OBOX 32- | 15,134,802.14 | RAFIKI 414270 | 14™ DEC,
CONTRACTO | 20211 KAPSOIT MICROFIN 2026
RS LIMITED ANACE
BANK
.| SEMOLINK P.O BOX 295- | 18,999,626.67 | SIDIAN 414,270 | 16™ DEC,
COMPANY 20100 BANK 2026
LIMITED NAKURU
.| JR MILES P.O BOX 108- |20,614.211.29 | RAFIKI 414270 | 15™ JAN,
CONSTRUCTI | 50200 MICROFIN 2027
ON LIMITED | BUNGOMA ANACE
BANK
8. | SAKENYA P.O BOX 19,046,386.09 | RAFIKI 414,270 | 18 FEB,
LIMITED 21728-00100 MICROFIN 2027
NAIROBI ANACE
BANK

9. | SAFEROADS | P.O BOX 19,695,366.24 | MIDDLE | 414,270 | 29™ APRIL,
CONSTRUCT! | 78189-00500 EAST 2027
ON LIMITED | NAIROBI BANK

KENYA
(MEB)

10. | PECAR P.O BOX 18,448,709.77 | RAFIKI 414270 | 13™
INVESTMENTS | 43949-00100 MICROFIN MARCH,
LIMITED NAIROBI ANACE 2027

BANK

11. | COBECA P.O BOX 394- |17,000,589.50 | BRANCH | 414,270 | 220 SEP,
VENTURES 20203 MICROFIN 2026
LIMITED LONDIANI ANCE

BANK

12. | COPYCATE P.O BOX 2707- | 18,179,371.10 | FAMILY 414270 | 8™ NOV,
ENTERPRISES | 20100 BANK 2026
LIMITED NAKURU

13. | VESONJERVJ | P.O BOX 900- | 24,989,818.94 | CO- 414270 | 16™ NOV,
LIMITED 20200 OPERATIV 2026

KERICHO E BANK

14. | MAMOLA P.O BOX 15,947,828.60 | FIDELITY | 414,270 | 220 NOV,
COMPANY 79938-00200 INSURANC 2026
LIMITED NAIROBI E BANK




NOTE:

FOR ANY CLARIFICATION OR CORRECTIONS PLEASE WRITE TO:
PRINCIPAL SECRETARY, STATE DEPARTMENT FOR AGRICULTURE
ATTENTION: HEAD SUPPLY CHAIN MANAGEMENT



